

<b>BID TABULATION</b>										
BID NO: 203135										
RFB - Rock Salt for Snow and Ice Control										
BASIS OF AWARD			KUNSHEK CHAT & COAL INC		CENTRAL SALT LLC		HUTCHINSON SALT COMPANY		Morton Salt	Compass Minerals America Inc
M Group 1										
Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total		
Salt Only (Delivered)	6,000.00	TN	\$75.00000	\$450,000.00	\$40.56000	\$243,360.00	\$37.26000	\$223,560.00	No Bid	No Bid
Salt Only (Pickup by City Staff or Designee)	6,000.00	TN		\$0.00	\$40.00000	\$240,000.00	\$28.00000	\$168,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Group 1 SubTotal</b>		\$75.00000	\$450,000.00	\$80.56000	\$483,360.00	\$65.26000	\$391,560.00		
	<b>Grand Total</b>		<b>\$75.00000</b>	<b>\$450,000.00</b>	<b>\$80.56000</b>	<b>\$483,360.00</b>	<b>\$65.26000</b>	<b>\$391,560.00</b>		

Award 05-19-2020 Primary Contract to Hutchinson Salt & Secondary Contract to Central Salt

Public Works & Utilities Department/Street Maintenance Division